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58th AU TIO~ SALE 

UNITED STATES 

FOREIGN 

U. S. & FOREIGN WHOLESALE 

STAMPS 

• 

AUCTION' SALE TO BE HELD 

Thut•sday, June 29th, 1939 
at 2 P.M. 

AT ROOM 616 116 NASSAU STREET 

• 
GREGORY MOZIAN, Auctioneer 

• 

ROBERT A. SIEGEL 
116 Nassau Street New York. N.Y. 

Telephone: BEekman 3-3167 



CATALOGUE 

• 

UNITED STATES 
Lot No. 

f~ 1* 1845 
till~ 1847 

Cat. Value 
5c New York, #17f, cut in design at R, without sign atme ... 150.00 

5c Red b1·own , # 28, veTy good , blue 10.00 

/ 0 v;:;,. 3* 1847 
J /~4 1847 

5c Pale brown, #28, margins all aro und, fine 40.00 

5c Red brown, # 28, on cover, tied ·with r ed grid cane, very good 12.00 

~ 3 1~ 5* 1847 5c Dark brown, #28, large margins all around, superb . 40.00 

.1. co ~ 1851-62 lc, 12c, 30c, 5c, 15c, # 32d, 51, 71, 76, 77, a ll slight defects... 23 .25 
_,~ .. 7 1851 3c Dull r ed # 33, P air , r ed grid can e, fine 5.50 
I f"l.- 8 1851 3c Dull reu # 33, Seven copies, varieties an d shad-es, fi.n e 

7:-~1851 5c R ed brown, # 34, MaTgins on t hree sides, cut int o d esign at 
left, v ery good ........................ . .... ............ .. .. .. ...... ........ .. ...... .. .. ... . 37 .50 

'!l!,1o 
J ~ ,;l.--11 

~f<.l ~ 
) 0~13* v-rv4 
¥~15 

2--1> I"' 16* 

1851 lOc Green, #35a p air , close a t R, otherwise :fine, blu e gr id ca.JlC 30.00+ 

1851 lOc Green, # 35b, very good 7.50 

1851 12c Black, # 36, p air, 2mm scissor cut in mm·gin of pair, :fine 30.00 

1857-61 l c, 3c, l c, 3c, # 42f, 44, 63, 65, fine .. ..... 6.15 

1857 5c R eel brown, # 'J..6, fine . 22.50 

1857 5c Red brown #46, 1858 year date cane, fine 40.00 

1857 5c Red 'brown, #46, light crease on back hardly visible on front, 

very good ....................... ...... .. .... ......... .... 250.00 

1857 

1857 

1861 

5c Brown, # 48a, r eel grid _c ane, fin e .. 

f2c Black, #51, pair, very good . 

l c, 3c, 10c, #63, 65, 68, v ery good 

12.00 

17.50 

12.25 

1861 3c Pink, #64, On cover, tied with Washington , D. C. cane., fine 35.00 

1861 3c Imperf. P air, On blue chemical p aper, # 65c, very fine, OG. 30 .00+ 

1861 5c Buff, #67, r epaiTecl, looks gooLl 30.00 
1861 

1861 

1861. 

1861 

1861 

1861 

5c Buff, # 67, R eel gr id can e, very goo tl 

5c Buff, #67, Magent:c cane, veTy goo d 

24c Brown lil ac, #70:c, very good 

24c Brown li la c, #70a, peds cut in l eft , very goo cl 

15c, 30c, #71, 77, v ery goocl ................ .. .. .... ....................... .. .. 

90c Blue # 72, p erfs cut i!l left . . .. ................... .. 

35 .00 

R5. 00 

10.00 

75 .00 

9.25 

15.00 

1862-67 2c Black, 1c B lue grilled #73, 94, t i ed on cov er ...... 9.25 

1862-73, 2c, 3c, 3c, #73, 114, 158, very goo d OG ............ .. .... .......... ...... ..... 6.50 

1867 2c Black , Grill-eel , # 87, on cover with black ca rri er c:m c, li st ed 

but not priced, fine ........ .................... ... ..... ......... .. . 
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lJ- 32 1867 

J ~33* 1867 

Lf~34 1867 
f{; o ~ 1869 

11!:., 36 1869 

}.-I :;,.. 37* 1869 

> 1 &) 38 1869 - 1869 

15c Black, Grilled, #98, perfs cut iu B .......................... . 
15c Black, Grilled, #98, slightly stained, OG . 
24c Gray lilac, Grilled, #99, very good .... . 
1c Buff, #112, fine, OG ................................................................... .. 
1c, 2c, 3c, # 112-14 

12c Green, #117, perfs cut iu '1', OG, Vel'Y goocl 

15c Brown & blu e, #119, very fin e ................................ .. 

15c Brown & blue, #119, fine ................................................................... .. 

6.00 
20.00 

30.00 
7.00 

5.40 
12.00 
·5.50 

17.50 'f l..,~ 

&)1;Q ""1o* 
l -

1869 30c Blue & cm·mine #121, well centered, very fi.ne except one 
perf. pulled ............. .. .................................... .. 

;t'"}41* 1875 10c Yellow, re-issue, #127, very fine OG ...... .. 

J 1,!..- 42 1870 6c Carmine, Grilled, No. 137, p erfs cut iu at top & right . 

50.00 
.. .... 27.50 

z.;'l:~ 1870 7c Vermilion, #149, fine..... .. ....................... .. 

1 'f!. 44 1873-1914 Pairs, 37, in cludes 14 commems, very fine lot ........................... .. ...... . 
.l "'Jr-45 1873 90c Rose carmin e, #166, very gooll 

12.00 

15.00 
14.47 

If'~ 46* 1873 
,a...~ 47* 1875 

90c Rose carmine, # 166, fine 
2c Vermilion #178, very fine 

2c, 3c, ·4c, 5c, 2c. # 183, 205, 210, 211, 213, very goocl, OG. 1 lf1.l ~ 1875-87 
..(6 ~ 49* 1879 

\f'b~5.0* 1879 
6c Dull pink, #186, very fine, OG ...................... .. .. .. 

9.00 

20.00 

6.00 
9:85 

10.00 
10.00 

9.00 ,. ~~ 51 1879 

1 6 ':!-52 1888 

').- f ~ 53*831890 

J" ~!!,_54* 1890 

) tr.:.. 55* 1!l93 

'(~56-.Jr 1893 

3 -:- 57*831893 
J-..., ~ ...... 58*831893 -~., ..r- 59*83.1893 

7 b '!. 60* 1893 
l.~ .... o~ 1893 

L 3~62* 1893 
f6!,63 1893 

(, ~~~ 1.893 

/ tfl'o .Ji~ . 1893 

'1-'0~ 1894 

6c Dull pink, #186, very fine OG 

90c Carmine #191, very goocl .......................................................... .. 
90c Purple #218, ve1·y goocl 

8c Lilac, #225, Block, fine ..... 

90c Orange, #229, ve1·y fine 

COLUMBIANS 

lc-8c # 230-36, fine, no gum ................................. . 
1c-10c Columbians #230-37, very goocl 
8c Columbian #236, Block ............ .. .. . 

8c Columbian # 236, Imprint plate no. block of 6, fine 
10c Columbian #237, Corner block, fin e 

15c Columbian #S238E, 11 Specimen'', fin e . ...................... . 

15c, 30c Columbian #238-39, Look fin e b ut thin spot of each 
50c Columbian # 2~.0, fine except thin spot .. .. 
$1.00 Columbian #241, lightly cane., very fine 

$2.00 Columbian #242, finely center eel, th in spot .................................. .. 
$3.00 Columbian # 24B, v eTy fine .......................... .. 

$1.00 Black #261, fin e .............................. .. 

9.00 

9.00 

8.00 

9.50 
11.75 
10.00 

15.00+ 
20.00 

25.00 
7.00 

10.00 
20.00 

25 .00 
45.00 

9.00 

) J a .Jj3-Jt 1894-192~1ic:~:;l~~-~l-~ll~ ~-~~·1~-~~e~- ~~.~J~-~~-age, 56 stamps, f ew str- edges, 
71.25 

0.80 

17.50 

27.50+ 

/~68* 1895 

I v "1;4...,...... r.9*831895 

Lf-11~70*831895 

/lj~l 1895 

3c-10c # 268-73, perfs cut in one sicle 

5c Chocolate #270, Imprint plate no. block of 6, very fine 

15c Dark blu e #274, Plate No. hlock, fine, no g um 

50c Red orange #275a, strip of 5, one dnmagell ...................... .. 
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l b ~ 17*ffi1898 

\•{··.:·. ······ ·················· ···· ················· 
$5.00 Dark ·green, .-#S2J78E,_. '' specimen' I nne """"'"""'"""""'" 
6c Lake .#282, ll;n.m·int.,block of 6, vertical perfs cut in 
10c Browll. #2S2c, Bl,o.ck, exc·ept crease, do esn't show on face 
15c O-live ·gTec;l #.28~,, Block, fine ..... 

. . :• . 
TRANS-MISSISSIPPI 

lc Trans-Miss. #285, Imprint plate · no. block oi' 6~ perfs cut in 
top, 

( ~ Gl ~ 1898 1c-10 c Trans-Miss. #285-90, thin spots, no gum 
l V .!---79* 1898 4c Trans-Miss. # .287, Ip.1print plate no. pair, fin e, no gum . 
)., -.~-,!.so* 1898 4c-10c Trans-Miss., # 287 ,go, off· cent.er ... .. ......... ......... . 

2.- 1 ll .S· 1898 50c Trans-Miss. #291, thin spots .................... . 

-~ -

4.00 
35.00 
23.00 
42.50 
27.GO 

8.00 

18.90 
10.00 

17.75 
18.00 

f6!.72 ·~ 1898 ... $1.00 Tr[;l.ns-Miss. # 292•, '' 98 '' .yea• ·date cane, fi.n e . 22,50 + 
1./t VC ~1898 · .$1.00 Trans-Miss·. #292; well c.entered, very fine .................... .. 

19 
,(!, .... ~ 1898.. $2.00 Trans-Miss ~ - ~293, Part OG, fine ................... ............................ ......... . 

35.00 
50,00 

I: 
II · 

~/~"!, si5j.JI31901 

t (eo ~ffi.1901 
I ~ 87* 1902 ,,..r' ~ffi1~,9_-~~ 
I ,f'o :SP ... 1902 
J' 1:!, ~p 1902 

t v-:- ~·t -t_EE1902 

l ~!-P.~* 1904 ' 
. • . j .. _:-. • .•. . . 

~ .- ~.a .... ffi1904 . 

l ~~*'ffi 1904 -- ., ii! • . 

-. , 

.{1~~1907 
!.)- - 96*ffi1907 

r ,- !J7*ffi1907 

r:_-9s#EE1907 

r -n.9.ffi1907 
'<(' ~ ,c 

J,. 1 9.)-00*ffi1907 

··- 1· • . • .• 

4c Pan-.A~¢dcan # 296, B)ock, very good .. 

10~ Pan~Ameri~a~ "'# 299, Blo~k, fine 
3c Violet # 302, Impri~t plat~lno . str~p of 3, perfs cut in R . 

4H· Bro~l'!-. #303,_ Block, nne .... .. ,, ........................... .. ........... ... .. 
_50c-$1.00 ;#3.10-311, fine....... ........... .. ......... .. ......... . 

$2.00 Dark b lue #312, very fi)le . .. .......................................... . 

5c Blue Imperf, #.~-~-5, !Jloc!f! _ S~perb .... ............... ................. .... .. ........... .. 
1c Louisiana # 32-3, Top ancl b.ottom imprint pl:;tte no. strips of 

17 .. 50 
27.50 
12.00 

6.50 
5.50 

10.00 
125.00 

. ~' ~,11~-i:j· ; ··· ·.tr t·: ·····:r\ ··:·:;":: ··· .. ;:·:, 
3c Louisiana #325, Blqy_Ji:, very goocl 
10c Louisiana #327, Block; very fi~1~ .............................. . 

10.20 
17.50 

............ ......... ...... 60.00 

• ~ · .. ~1 . 

·. , 
JAMES~ OWNS 

1c-5c J.iinrest<lwil #328-30.; Bloc-Jcs,. ·P erfs cut one side, very goocl 
1c-5c Jam~stown - #328-30; Blecks, P eri's cut .one side, very goocl 

lc-5c Ja.mestown # --3 28:30, Blbcks, lferFs cut on e sicl e, very good 

1c-5c ;Jamestown #'328~ ?.0, B'iocks, PerfR cut; one sicl e, very good 

lc-5c .Ta!n.e~to1vn .#1!2$-30, J?locb, Perf's cut one side, very goocl 
-·• :.:..C: ~ •'• ~-~~ · .J ·~ • '-' •·• I . •• ,_ ·• . • 

.2c .Jam estown # 329, · 'l'flp .,platc no. impril't bloek of 1(;
1 

looks 

38.00 
38.00 

38.00 

38.00 

38.00 

x·.~rx filre, r.e-inforced .on bnrk .. ....... .. ... .. .. ....... , ......... .... .. .. ...... , .. ,. , .. .. ... ... ,. ...... 10.00+ 

""'\ 

' 

, I 
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tf~.E-~1907 
J -;- 102 1908-10 

1 )o ~ -1908 

'V ~ 104* 1908 
7,...-1 D ~ 1908 
r:_t£_ 106* 1908 

J 9.r ~ 1908 
Jr~'V ~ 1908 

'1/'-1 () ~ 1908 

~~110* 1908 

/ 3,_!2;.11*ffil909 

.J,/ 0 ~1909 
j,.. 6;_ 113* 1909 

'i- b2,. 114* 1909 
1 ,.t"S. ll5*ffil910 

1 ~.! 116* 1910 
2- tP..r~ 1910 

I D --::' 118*ffil910 

) b.) ~ 1910 

I~~ 120* 191o 
r ..... .2. 121 *EE1913 

6 V!-122*ffi1912 
1}4fi ..... R23* 1912 

1 -..1!,.. 124*ffi1912 

"1..-1 ~25* 1912 
1.- (f.:: 126* 1915 

I ~ -t""O . . ffi1915 

'J.-'~ ~ 1915 

:> ,;: 129ffi 1915 
,,~ ~ffi1912 

j;... I ~ 131* 1912 

1 .., ~ 132*ffi1912 

J 1,2... 133* 1912 

f ~34*ffi191 2 
~til ~8319 1 2 
1 -;' 136*ffi1914 

?.r ~EE1914 
~ 'VO ~1914 

r.. ":" ~ffi1914 
(i'r<> ~ 1914 

tc~~l41*ffi1915 I 0 7 J~ffi1916 
~~~143*ffi1916 

5c .Jamestown #330, Block, Shift in "5" ribbons" fine for this 60.00 

3c Violet # 333, 376 (2), Blocks, fine ... ........ . .............. ............... ...... 11.00 

5c-15c # 335-40, P erfs cut in one side 12.75 
50c Violet #341, center ed to left , v ery good .............. .......... . 10.00 

1c Green, imperf., #343, B lock of 12 & 14, gum c1·eases on back 9.75 

4c Brown, Coil, # 350, paste up pair, fin e . 30.00 

5c Blue, Coil, #351, P air, v ery fin e 9.00 

4c Orange bro wn, #354, Pair, fin e . 18.00 

5c Blue, Coil, # 355, Pair, fin e . 10.00 

2c Bluish # 358, v ery fin e . 5.00 

2c Lincoln #367, Imprint plate no. block of 16, p erfs cut in 

on part ...... . 

2c Lincoln, Imperf # 368, Block, very; fine 
2c Hudson-Fulton, Imperf . #373, Horiz pair, very fi n e 

2c Hudson-Fulton, Imperf. #373, Horiz pair, v ery fine 

4c Brown, #377, Imprint plate no. block of 6, fine ............... ...... .. ... . 

10c Yellow, 15c U ltramarine #381-82, perfs cut in one side ..... 

15c P ale ultrama1·ine #382, very fine ..... ... . 

15c Pale ultramarine #382, Block, fin e ... .. .. . 

2c Carmin e Imperf. #384, Block of 6, on Register·ed cover, 

ve1·y fin e ........... .......... .............. ... . 

1c Green, 2c Carmine, Coils, #392-393, P airs, fin e 

5c Pan-Pacific #399, Plate no. block, perfs cut in L ...... ... .. .. ....... . 

11.25 

il.OO 
5.50 

5.50 

8.50 

10:50 

6.50 

27.50 

10.50 

7.00 

22.50 
5c Pan-Pacific #399, Block, v ery good .. .. .......... ................ 22:50 

10c Pan-Pacific #400, fine ...... ... ... .... ... ................ .. ...... .... _7 .00 

10c Pan-Pacific #400, Block, p e1·fs ba1·ely touch 1 side, v. good 40.00 

10c Ora nge, P a n-Pacific #400a, Pel'fs cut in left 

2c Pan-P acific #402, fin e ............. ...... ... .. .. .... ................... . 

2c P an-Pacific #402, Block, very fine . 

5c Pan-Pacific #403, fine ... . ............................. . 

10c P an-Pacific #404, Block, perfs nibbed on sid e of one stamp 

7c Black #407, Block, v ery fine .... 

8c-15c #414-18, v ery good ....... . 

9c Salmon red #415, B lock, off center ....... ..... ...... .. ..... .......... .......... . 

20c Ultramar in e #419, fine 

30c Orange r ed #420, Block , fin e . 

30c Orange r ed #420, Block, fin e 

3c Viole t # 426, Block, Pink back, p erfs cut in R 

6c Red orange #429, Block, very good 

9c Salmon r ed #432, Block, very fin e 

15c Gray #437, Block, very fine . 

$1.00 Violet black, #460, fine ................. . 

2c Carmine #461, Top plate no. block of 6, fine 

10.00 

7.50 
35.00 

7.50 

35.00 

30.00 

10.50 

io.oo 
6.00 ... 

25.00 

25.00 

6.50-j-

10.00 

11.50 

25.00 

25.00 

75.00 ~ . 

:3c Violet , #464, B lock, v ery fin e . ... ...... .. ......... ... ............... il5.00 

5c Carmin e E rror # 467, Double error in block of 15, 3x5, fin e 110.00 
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J c J!. J..44ft1916 
..... ~ 145*83191(i 

Jtf-;"!4683*191(i 

1 ..t"",-:~.47*831917 
Jo_,~ .. ~831917 

_(lA/ 149*831917 

11Z15o*831917 

.:1 ~"!.151 *831917 

'P ~ 152* 1917 

I 0 ..r~ 1~ 1918 

7 ;-154*831918 

/ 9 -..,_;!.....155ffi 1918 

u "': -:15683 1918 
t 1() ~ 1918 

' , .. 158*831918 
1,- I 2,..159*831919 

if ~160*831919 
..f ~ 1:61*£81919 

1 o .V".w4831919 
~ ~ V 63* 1919 ...,vo ~ 1919 

1 ,,.,.(·~~831920 
rk"l ~ 1920 

\. -viA"~ 1920 

f' 7£168*831920 

1 l> ..:!)69*831920 

:JOe Ultramarine #476, Block, very fin e 

3c Violet, Imperf, #483, Block of 6, ve ry fine . 

3c Violet, Imperf, #483a, center line block, very fin e . 

5c E•rror, #505, in middle of strip of 3, very fine . 

5c Rose error #505, Double error in block of 12, fi ne to v . fine 

9c Salmon #509, Plate no. block of 36, fine ..... 

30c Orange 1·ed, #516, Block, fine 

30c Orang:e r ed #516, plate no. block of 6, very fin e . 

$1.00 Brown black, #518a, fin e ... 

$2.00 Ora nge & black #523, ve ry fin e . 

1c Gray green #525, Top plate no. block of 6, no horizo ntal 

perforations on top row, interesting unlisted variety, fin e 

lc Gray green #531, Center lin e block, preeanc Chicago, fine 

1c Gray green, Imperf, #531, L eft plate no . lJlock of G, v. fin e 

2c Carmine, Imperf. #532b, t yp e VI pair, ve ry fin e 

1c Gray green #536, Plate no. block of 6, fin e ... 

3c Victmy #537, Top plate no. blo ck of 6 . 

1c Green #545, Block, perfs cut in R .. 

1c Green #545, Block, perfs cut in R .. 

1c Green #545, Block, v ery fine for this . 

2c Carmine rose #546, P air ...................................... . 

2c Carmine ·ros e # .546, Strip of 3 

$2 .00 Carmine & black, #547, Block, very fin e ... 

1c Pilgrim #548, Sheet of 70, v ery good . 

2c Pilgrim #549, Sheet of 70, perfs tou ch left . . 

1c-5c Pilgrim #548-50, Block s, fine 

5c Pilgrim #550, Block, very fine .. . 

/..(.(0 11083 1920-32 Commemorativ e blocks, 55 diff. mounted, includ es # 550, li12, 
' ..;" 616, 619, 621, 630, fine Jot . 

I b ~171* 1922-34 Postal Congress Souvenir Booklet, Bound in blue cloth by 

Post Office Dept., 28 diff. stamps, includes #552-573, 614-16, 

'-{ 13.---~922 
,{""'lA.: 173*831922 

1 1 ~74*831922 
2-- ',('\)_l75*831922 

I J-11_ 176*831922 v., £ 177'*831922 

'l--~17883 1922 

I )... ~ . .17983 1922 

v ~18083 1922 

1 vi!).8183 1922 

..;1-J'~ 1922 

J G~83*831922 

1303-05, etc; face value $11.28, fine, has sold at $35.00 ...... ....... ....... ... . 

% c-50c #551-570, fine 

2c Carmine #554, Ten diff., plate no. blocks of 6, fin e . 

3c Violet, #555, Block , fin e .. 

5c-8c #557-560, Blocks, perfs cut in one side 

llc Yellow green #563c, Block of 9, fine . 

25c Green, 30c Olive brown #568-69, Blocks, very fine. 

$5.00 Carmine & blue #573, Block , v ery fin e 

$5.00 Carmine & blue #573, Block, very fine .. : 

$5.00 Carmine & blue #573, Block, very fine . 

$5.00 Carmine & blue #573, Top arrow block of 4, very :fine .... 

$5.00 Carmine & blue # 573, Center line block, very fin e . 

1c Gt'een, Imperf, #575, Right plate no. block of 6, very fine .. 

-7-

45.00 
7,00 

25 .00 

25.00+ 
55.00 

17.50 

6.00 

10.50 

10.00 

25.00 

25 .00 

15.00 

3.50 

17.50 

6.50 

37.50 

37.50 

37 .. 50 
12.00 

18.00 

32.50 

29.~5 

58.50 

21.25 

Hi.OO 

7~ . 25 

12.28 

17.50 

6.00 

15.00 
.. 9.00 

7;50 

6.'00 

6.0.0 

6.00 

42.50 

45.00 

10.00 
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I .P!:J--1'6±* Hill~ 
v r-1~5*Dl92~ 

1 .. 1r~rn1922-26 

..rt~u ~ 1922 
).. --188ffi. 1923-36 

~G) 189*ffi1923 

), ll> 190*ffi1923 
..-: I ,i..J 191* 1924 

"()192*ffi192>±-25 ),r, ..--
~ ?f_ Hl3 * 192± 

3J--~ 1924 

i..f'f;.-195* 1925 

I I V 96* ffil925 
<l'+~ 197* ffil925 

4_'42.,. 198*ffi1925 
,J- I~ 199*ffi1925 

$ ..-..::,. 200*ffi1925 

I ~..! 201*ffi1926 
Y-: .f_! 202ffi 1926 

f :-" ~203*ffi192G 

~ ~ 204.*ffi1927 

1 -;" 205* 1928 

1.--''f-U ~1928 
1 PJ'~1928 

1.--t'~~-1928 
. , r~- 209* ffi 1928 

v --
4-~ ~10~ 1928 

~2llffi 192!J-3a 

4- 7"' 212 192fl 

t ~ (:)o 213* 1929 

t.t~.t" 214*ffi19 2·9 
/ t..:.... 2Hi*ffi,1929 

1 ,&',!..216*ffil929 

'),.- '~ 217*ffi,1929 

I I !-218ffi 1929 

'}.. -(' 219*ffi,1931 

/ bu~220*ffil932 

], ~ 221* 1932 

lt: G1·uul! #57'6, 1·cry line ... ....... .... : .... : ..... 

lc Green #570, VeJ:y good · · 

1u-l0c, #581-591, Bloliks, complete, v ery fine .'. 

2c Carmine #595, v e ry fin e .... 

Commemoratives, J 7 cliff. blocks, fine 

25.00 

33.70 

.. ...... ....... .... ... -.. >15:oo 

·5:29 

2c Harding #611, 6 cliff. P late Jto . blo ck s of 4, p{'1:fs ci.1t in . 

2c Harding #613, block of t en, p erfs j'u'st totH~h at L . 

lc ' Valloon # 614, b lock of 16, veq fin e . 

lc ' Valloon , l c, 2c L exington, #614, 17-18., Plate no .. blocks of 

four ... ..... .. ............ ·········· i'"","' ''. 

5c 'Valloon #li1G, Plate no. single. with b,rok en circ,le varie ty, 

very fin e 

5c Walloon #GIG, Broken .c,ircle Vt\ riety , .. , .. 

5c Lexington #G19, P l.ate ~o:, bloc,lc ,'qf (j 
) ,- .. 

2c Norse . # G20, Ano•y b.\pck, ver)\ . :fin~ .. 

5c Norse, #621, Block , fin e . 

5c Norse #621, Block , v er y Jine .. 7 ,.. .. ... .... r ·:·· 

·· · ---~·-· ··,, 

5c No1·s r, #G2.1, Bottom arrow bloc!~, v er y fin!) ,.... . .... . , .... .. ... . 
13c, H e, #G22, li23, 'rll'o shades of . e!lch .. ~ n · ,bl qck,s, ver y fin~ ... , ... . . ' . ~ ·. 
'.!.c Whit e Plai ns, #(i29, b lock of 16 ,.,,,.,.., ..... : .. y;· .. 

2c White Plain s Exhibition ~bee t of 2,~ , #?3P1~.r ~ d qnnc, 1·)ine 

6.00+ 
14.50 

6.00 

7.50+ 

::!·50 
10.00 

-· 3.50 
0.00 

9.00 ,, 
l 2.QO 

~ . 75 

5.0.0 

f).OO 

11h c Harding Imperf. #G31, S et of ·4 ~liff: plate n o. b loclcs,··=· 
v e ry fine ............................... : .. ....... ,.,; .. : ... . t ~ ! r 

. .... ,,:, 20.00 

2·c Burgoyn e #64.( 'l'wo cliff. phte no~ block s of 6 . . ·: ' , '"6.50 

2c :Molly Pitch er # G4G, On·e ro•~· 'stnit checl '' PH.ch cr ' ' , fin ~< ::• ....... 
2c-5c Ha11·aii #G47-48·, Blo'clcs, ver y fi.ne.. , . , . ·' 5.75 

2c Hawaii #647, Sheet of 100, perfs tou ch "on pa rt . 37.50 

5c Hawaii #648, Sheet of 100, perfs barely touch at B, v . good 106.25 

2oc-5c A eron(Lu tics #6±9-50, Blocks,, of ,lG,. ver y fi ue 1±.80 

Fil'st Graf Zeppelin flight cov ei·, U.S . to Ger mmry, l'ostngc 

$1 .05, fine 

Commemoratisc blockB, :n LlifL, fin er : 5.:10 
l u- lOc Kansas & N cbrasktt #li5S -7!J, . .-e'ry :..:outl ~d ....................... .. .. : J4 ::w 

lc-lOc Kansas &; Ncbrasha #G5S-li7fl, · ve ry .guod 'set ...... · ·:Jl:'AG 

4.c, 5c Kansas #li62 - G~l, Plate 110. IJ]o ·ck~, [J!H.fs cuf· Ill one s id e ·:. IJ.:75 

lk Kansas #oo7, Plate no. b lock, 'fi nc .. .. ............ : .. : ......... : .... ... .. .. ....... !. ,_· 4.75 

lOc Kansas #lioS, Plate no. l.Jlock, Perfs cut 1c'ft .... · ......... .... .. .... :' .;. ·-:. 7:5o 

'lc Nebraska #676, Plate no: blo ck, very goo d ........ ... :.... ::B·:oo 

9c N ebraska #o78, Plate no. block, precanc·: .. ... . . .. .. .. 20·.00 

2c Yorktown #703, Pla t e no. b lock of 40, very fin e 

Ihc-10c ·Bicentennial #704-715, Complete set of blocks of 20 

each, many with plate nos ., very fine . 

lh c Bicen tennial, # 704, two sheets of 100 each .... ... ........... .. ...... .. .. 

-8-
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57.25 

7.50 
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I 

t 

" f7;!..... 224* 1934 
v v!., 225* 1934 

~ , - 226* 1934 

6 ~227*ffi1935 

b ;-228*ffi1935 

) ~~ 2ill*ffi1918 
~~~232*ffi19 18 
1 ,,2. 233*ffi.1923 

J VI) ~ffi1923 

6 'lJ-~923 
:l ~ 236* 1923 

·z 6 f) 236a*ffi.1923 ,, 7£ 237* 1930 

1 :"""" 238*ffi1933 
Lf'J ..... ~239* 1912 

J ~240 1873 

7 1f~ 1873 
3 ;"242 1873 

7l'.-10c Bl.ce'utuunla1, #7U-l5, l'latc 11.0. blocks, line .. 8.% 

3c-iic Oly mvie #718-1!J, 'l'hr cc Lli.lf. p late uo. IJ'lock s of each, 

oJI cente r .. 7.80 . 

3c Moth ers Day, #737-38, Sheet of 50 of each, fin e . 1.LOO 

l c, 2c Parks, #740-741, S h·eet of 50 of each , fine . 4.00 

5c Park #744, Sheet of 50, fine . 8.00 

1c-10c Parks, Parleys, # 756-765, Set of top plate no. blocks of 

6, very fine . .. . 22.-lO 

1e-10c Parks, Parl eys #156-65, Set of top pla te no . block s of 

6, v ery fine 22.4.0 

16c Specia l Air, Farley #771, Center line block, very fine . 35.00 

$1.00 Presidential, #832, Top plnte no. b lock of 45, very fine 

AIRMAILS 

Gc Orange # 13001 Top ar row b lock, fin e . .. 

24c Carmin e rose & blue # 1302•, Block, fine ... 

8c Dark green #1303, Block, v-ery fine 

8c Dark green # 1303, Top pla t e no. blo ck of 6, very fine . 

16c Dark blue #1304, Block, fin e 

1Gc, 24c, # 1304-05, very fine 

24c Carmine #13051 Block, v ery fin e 
65c-$2.60 Graf Zeppelin #1312-14, very fine set .. .. 

50c Graf Zeppelin # 1317, B lock, very fi nc 

$1.00 Pa1·eel Post #1461, centered to right, v ery goocl .. . 

3c Executive #1511, YCJ'Y good . 

90c Justice # 1533, very good ... .. .. .... .... ..... .. ................. ......... .. 
7c Navy #1538, fin e .. 

!J .OO · 
13.50 

:3 .50 

7.00 

17.50 

v ")!,.. 243 1873 2c Navy # 1535, with Steamship can e, very good .. 

7.50 

20.00 

45.00 

15.00 

15_,Qp 
15.,...00 
40.00 
15.00 

10.00 

15.00 

50 .00 

l,.- .ru,-244* 1873 15c, 24c Navy # 1541-42, very goocl 

1 ...-~ 1873 $2.00 St ate, # 1567, looks fine but one cor ne1· r epa ired . 

;~~ 246* 1873 15c Treasury #1578, very good 

-, .('2,24i* 1873 2c War #1583, Perfs cut in H . 

<i .OO 

10.00 
1:;,:;5 V ');;:248* 1873 10c-90c, \Yar Dept . #158 ·7-0:2, liu e . 

y+o~ 1879 90c Treasury #162o, fiue 8.00 

1•~ ~*ffi1911 $1.00 Postal Savings #1637, Plate no. block ; fine . 30.00 + 

/ jl"'~ 1858 2c Elm, B1·own & McGillis , USPO Dispatch #1842, v ery fine 50 .00 

fj~ 251* 1842 3c on blue, New York Carrier #1848, part OG, fine margins, v.f. 75.00 

),J~ 211~*ffi1885 10c Special D elivery #1890, Block, perfs cut right.... 17.50 

I ~ 253* 1888-1911 1?c Special D elivery, 10c Registry #1891, 1893, 1951, p erfs 
cut in one side .. 

~ 

l- va,.......... 254* 1895 

~ ~~ 255 1895 
10c Specia l Delivery #1894, I mprint plat-e no . strip, fin e . ... 

1c-$2•0.00 Newspapers, #2087-96, fine 

-9-

6.50 

6.00 

12.80 
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30c Postage :Due # 3263b, Block, ]JCrfs cu t in left. . 12.50 

50c Postage D ue # 227il, Block, thin spot uHe ~tam p (i .50 

$5.00 Pos tage Due, #2284, fin e 10.00 

185:-J 3c R ed ou 'White Bntirc # 23 05 with 'Wells Fargo frank anJ 

cane with \~Tells F argo oval, Chinese Camp, fin e . - -

1853 3c Red on Buff Entire, # 2314, same description as above . 
1919-22 2c-$2.00 Shanghai #3280-99 complete, including offsets, fine 

to very fine . 

REVENUES 
. # t I.:- ~(j2 1SU2 

I '.! 203 1Sli3 
1~ Prowiota ry # 3802c, Block of 30, Hand s tamp 2cl , Ycry good 

1 ~ ,2..- 2li4 1862 
~ c In ternal H.cvenu c #3814E, Green pn pL'r, small tea r, sca rce 
:'c Proprietaq # 3812b, very good 

6 -v~:.'65*ffi1S62 2c Int ern a l H.evenu e #38Hc, Block of 64, fiJJc , OG . 
1 u 1A...::Zuu ffi1SG2 4c Inland Exchange # 3819c, Block of 25, very go od . 

30c F or eign Exeltange, # 3850c, ver y good '1.; '\r' l4 18li2 
t 6-J""26S 1862 -/-.l-,2. 269 1862 $3 .50 Inland E•xch ange #3886c, ve ry good 

-J'" :'" 270 1862 $10 .00 Probate of Will #3895a, ve ry good . 

$1.GO F or eign Exehange #38 78c, ver y good 

1 )0 ~ 1874 2c Orange & Black, On Green, Inverted Center #3966, v. good 
l r ~ ~ffi.1875 2c Brown # 3984b, Block of 37, ver y g ood OG. 

').- '\ !,.. :3 73 1914 Black Proprietary, 36 stamps, Beh,· oon #4111-51, som e mtusell 

j t) t:) ~ 1864 20r, Grea t Cen t ra l Fair, Phil a, # Sf ·G2, fine, h1·o copies 
l ..!~ ~ 75 Con f ell erato S tates, 181il , 5c Green #200 (2) , # 20 0b, fair. 

/ -;"' :? lli Coll fedo ra J·o Sta tes, J Sfil , 5c Dark g ree n # 200b, vc ry good . 

11r ~ Co nfe derat e State~, 18(i:.', 5c Light •nilky blue #203b, small thin spot 
7 '!...! ...... ~ Confederate States, 1862, 10c Rose, #204, very fine except thin spot . 

p ":"-y C'onfe cl c rat o States, 18li2-U3, 5c Blue, 10c B.lu e #2•06 (5), # 2llc, Y . good 

I .f'2- ~8o 
ll.!- 281 

1 v ,- 2S2 

I - QO~ • .;.. o U 

I i~·284 
,., f""" :.'85 

z,. o_!.~tt-
;J. . .-r· 287 

1 1 ,.!.. 288 . -t"\A_ 289 

~ :'290 

PRECANCELS 

1908-1'7, 350 preca nc, lll any timall towns . 

Btuo Prints, 500 cliff . .................... ........... .. ... ..... ................................... ..................... . ............... ............ .. 

Buro Prints, 1295 diff. , Retail value $60 .00, fine lot ............................................ . 
Double line electro s, 34G cliff., Retails $20 .00 . 
360 Precanc., l\{any small 'ro"·ns . 

3·75 Prccanc., Nittny sm all To1n1s 

400 Precanc, ::IJany small 'l'o,Yns . 

Dated precanc, 500 mixe d, f r om July 1938-Mtty 1939 . 

Dated precan c, ll c New York City, 500, from July 1938-May 1939 . 

Bicentennial precan c., 100 mixed 

4,000 Precanc, "T orth examining 

- 10 - -

36.40 

10.00 

15.00 

10.00 

6.00 

75.00 

20.00 

14. 5U 

2U.OO 

7.50 

20.00 

60.00 

l. 



~~~~3 
],Cf~94 

6.t"or 
7- l·.:!,29 G 

(JO~ 
jl~!JS 

'3 I '!, 299 

J }~0 
-vt~3o1 
z, ~~ 302 

/1.! 803 
1 ~ 304 
i)... ;-' 305 

t bu ~ 
1 ;- 307 .,. 

[ '1~ 308 
' 7./'309* 

' r-J~* 
1-- I _!. 311 

f '-t.!..J12 

1 s~:m 
J I 0 314 
)& ~~ 
{ I J-316 

J 0,!. 317 

I -:- 318 

I J'U~ 
. ~1;.il20 
J -;- 321 

}....-,~~ 

1 ~323 
,yO ~ 

' 3~~ 
-.(o~ 

.r':"il27 

~tu~ 

;1~29 

Buro Prints, 5 Packets o£ aoo cliff. eac h . 

Buro Print.ti, 10 PHckets of 100 dift'., eac h . 

U. S. WHOLESALE 

1857-63 1c, 2c, 10c, #42£ (3), 68 (4) , 73 (4), vel'.)' good. 11.00 

1857,69 1c, 1c, 2c, 2c, #42£ (4), 63 (3), 73 (8), 93 (3), 113 (5), all 

seconds 28.00 

1857 3c Dull r ed #4-! (60) fair . ... 6.00 

1857 3c Dull red #44 (100) 10.00 

1867 3c Red , Grilled #94 (100) fair . 30.00 

1869 3c Locomot.ive #114 (40) 6.00 

1870 

1870;73 

1873 

1875 

18/9 

1882-88 

1883 

189 0 

1893 

1893 

1898 

1898 

1898 

1898 

3c Green, GriJied # 136 (35) 

2•c Bro1m, 2c Red brown #146, 157 (80 mixed ) 

Gc Dull pink #159 (4 0) fair . 

5c Blue #179 ( 60 ) all damaged . .. 

Gc Pink #186 (44 ) all damaged . 

5c, 4c, 5c # 205 (10 ) , 215 (13) , 216 (12) fau ... . 

4c Blu e green # 211 (3G) poor to good ... 

3c Purple #221 (35 ) fair .. .. 

2c Columbian #231 (100) all crack ed Hat variety .. 

5c Columbian #234 (25) very good. 

4c R.ose brown #280 (10) fair. 

5c Dark blu e #281 (15 ) fair . 

lOc Brown #282c (GO) 

15c Olive green #284 (10 ) 

10.50 · 

24.00 

14.00 

45.00 

55 .00 

15.85 

18.00 

14.00 

10.00 

10.00 

15.00 

12.75 

15.00 

7.00 

18[)8 1c Trans-Miss. #'.!.85 ( 25 ) Yrry goo<~ . 7.50 

18!)8 5c Trans-Miss. #288 (6) very good . 12.00 

1908-14 # 333 (100), ·113 (SOO ), 453 (600 ), 453b (400 ), poor to good ...... 360.00 ', . 

1908-10 4c Bro~nl # 334, 377 (200 ) mixf'd wmkds, very good ........... 10.00+ 

1908-10 

1908 

1910 

1910 

1910 

1910 

1912 

1912 

1912 

1!110 

6c R.ecl orange #336, 379 (20 5) mixed mnkds, very good ............ 22.50+ . 

2c Carmine, Coil # 349 (12) 12.00 

3c Violet # 376 ( 70 ) very good .. · 17.50. 

Sc Olive gr een #380 (10 ) ver y good . 20.00 

8c Olive green #380 (15) v eTy good 30.00 

15c Pale ultramarine #382 (16) v ery good . . 24.00 

10c Pan-Pacific #400 (11) perf. initialed 11.00 

2c Carmine, Coil , #411 (50 ) f ai r 17.50 

2c Carmine, Coil #411 (300 ) fair ... ... ... 105.00 

~c Carmine , Coil #413 (100 ) fair 15.00 

1!!12-18 #413 (800 ) , 453a (300), 4.53b (640), 491a (18), 526 (1000) fair 

1912 

1912 

to goocl . ................................................................. .......... ... ...... 538.00 

8c Olive green #414 (160 ) very good . 

30c Orange r ed #420 (25) very good : .... 

- 11 -

23.70 

25 .00 
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I I 

I 
I 

• r 
I 

I ~ :J3o*: 
/ . y-~ :331 

f .- 332 

6o ~ 
)Y~ 
1 ~335* 
.J I ~336 
'1 ~..)!37 

, f oJ-338 .a,_ 
3 ~3:39 

)7-1~ 
1 ->~341EE 
ifG~B42 

1-- 1 _.c-a-±3* 
6 ~ :344 

1.1 .,!.345 

I t~46* 
t i 347* 

1.-1 C u8* 
yJ'~ ... 349 

L '1 ~B50EE 
'f-;-351* 

-,-~--. .......,.... - ~- -~ _._ -~ 

HJ14 :!~ Violet #426 (8) ...... . .. ....... ........ 10.0 

1914·16 5~ Blue #4'3S, 466 . (110 ) mixed wmkds, nry good ······· ·· '··················· 12.50 
1914c16 8e Olive green #4:31, 470 (~5 ) mixetl wmkds, very good . 10.00+ 

1914 30c Orange red· #439 (20) fair . ... ...... ........ .. ................ 15.00 

1914-17 #453a ( 400), 453b (840), 491a (17), 501 (1200 ) fair to good 343.00 

1916 2c Ca1·mine, Coil #453 (50 ) , in pairs . 12.50 

1916 5c Blue #466 (65), very good ....... .......... . ........... ..... .......... 16.25 

1916 7c Black #469 (25) ve1·y good 18.75 

1916 

1916 

1916 

1922 

1922 

1922 

15c Gray #475 (17) very goo(l . 

20c Ultramarine #476 (17) very good 

3c Violet, Coil #489 (100 ) in strips, fine . 

lf2c Olive brown #551 (100 blocks) fine . 

$5.00 carmine & blue #573 (20) 

8c Olive green #589 (2) fine 

192•2·28, %c·50c (11,000 stamps) all bundled no common 1e, 2c, 3c 

values, nice lot 

19::!:3 

19~5 

1926 

1926 

1928 

1929 

1929-31 

2. Harding, #611 (258 ) ........ . .............. ........... . 

5c Lex-Conco1·d #G19 (10 ) perfs cut in one side . . 

2c Sesqui, 2c White Plains #627, 629 (10 each ) , fine . 

5c Ericsson # 628 ( 10) fine . 

2c Aeronautics #649 (90 ) , v ery good . 

2c Cla1·k #651 (10 blocks), fine ..... . 

2c Commem. #654 (18), 657 (29 ) , ti80 (20 ) , 682 (16 ) , 683 ( 7), 

21.25 

2•1.25 

12.00 

8.00 ' 
20.00 

12.00 

10.32 

12.50 

5.00 

6.50 

'6:oo 
5.00 

688 (8), 690 (-!8), fine except all hav·e one str. edge ........ 17.-!3 

1c, 1% c Kansas # 658-659 ( 5 ]Jlate no. blocks each), p erfs 

cut in 10.00 

I' e 353*ffi19:!!l 1e, 11hc Kansas #658-59 (5 Plate no. blocks each) perfs cut in 10.00 

t,!I~354*EE1929 1c, 1%c, 2c, Nebraska #669-671 (3 plate no. blocks each ) 

{ j~- . - 19:31 2c R.ed Cross, #702 (200) .... ....... .............. .. . .................. . 

/ 61d ~ 1932 %c Bicentennial #704 (400 ) in blocks 

yi_!..357*EE1932 1%c Bicentennial #706 (6-!) in blocks 

)..-~5883 1932 7c Bicentennial #712 (25 blocks) very fine 

c..l f u ~ • 1932-38 Commems (2000 mixed), includes 4i~ , 5c valnes, very good lot 

J'3 0 ~ 19::!3-37 3e Comn~erus (3600 mixed) 

9.::!0 

10.00 

8.00 

6.00 

]-v,:J"!,.3G1* 1934 a~ Byrd Exhibition i:lheetti of u, #135 (100 tiheets ) Vl'l')' fine ]00.00 

v > .::!-- 'J6~*EE.l93 ,! ~c Park # 741 ( 84) in blocks, fine ....... ........ ..... ........ 4.20 

q 0,!.363 1935-37 :Jc Commems (6000) assorted, Yery good lot 

/ I ~l64* 19::!6 3c 'l'ipex #778 (100 sheets) ve ry fine . 35.00 

tf 7'365 1938 10c S. P. A. #797- (100 sheets), nne . .. . 

j,-.5~366 1938 $5.00 Coolidge Presidel).t #834 (4), v ery nne ..... 

J ~0 ~ 1938 3c Northwest #837 (100 ) , some blocks, fin e . 

/l-<l_. ~ 1918 6c Orange, Air, # 1300 (7), each has str edge . 

( t? !-369* 1923 16c D~rk Blue #1304 ( 4) pel'fs cut in B 

/t !-370 1926 lOc Map, .A.h:, #1306 (100) very good ... 

2,.-.{\J ~ 1914-16 10c Special Delivery #1898 (50), 1899 (12) 

-}2-

lL. 0 Jo ..... .:: 

15.00 

5.00 

14.00 

6.00 

18.00 



'1 0 ~ 1!H6 10c ::>pedal Deliv ery #11:1!!\J (10) 

f"o~ :! 7383 1!!17 . 50c 1>ostagc Due #'2273 (1000 ) in large lJiocks, precanc . 

HH8-23 1c, 2c, 4e, 2Gc, Future Delive r ~· # _4401, 4403, _4406, 4422 (100 

10.00 

100.00 

of each, cut cane .. . ................ .................... .... .... ....................... .. .. ... . . L .OO -')..(l_. ... ;..:J-75 1918 $3.00 Futme Delivery #4412 (100 ) , lightly cut cane. 

FOREIGN 

J I ~ 376* Argentiu e, 186-± 5c Lake, #lla, very gooll .. 

J8'0 ~ 
,---~ 
~~ 

--1860, 4r Green, Buenos Aires, #9, fine . 

--18(10-62, 1p blue, 1p rose, Buenos Aires, #10, 12, one unused . 

B a d·en 1864 18kr Green #24, very good, no gum ........................ .. .. . 

)..-V'O ~ Bahamas 1861 1p Lake #'2 
l ( ,:; ..:.l8-J.-* - - 18·75, 1p Carmine Jake # 17a, fine 

/ 7tJ · Bangkok 1882 4c, 6c, #4, 12, fine 

)... ~ ~ --1882-83 #4, 13, H, 16, 19, part unused, very good 

'). ..(o ~ Barbados 1916-11 3sh , 3sh #137, 139, y ery good . 

J...-- ~385* B ~lgium 1866 10c-40c #18-21, v CI'Y good . 

J 1.:)380* --18li6-67, 1c-5c #24-27, 27a 

~ ~· ~ Bra zil 1861 430r Yellow, slightly def ective #40 

\ l'~> ~ Belgimn 1897 5c, 10c, Miniature sheets of 25, . #74, 70, thr-ee sheets of 
each, Retails for $12.00 .... .. . ................... . 

,_, , ~ ~ 

t.f< 390* 

Bremen 1861 2gr Orange #5, no gum. 

British Coronations H)37, Crown Colonies complete, 135. sta mps, fine . 

IVO ~British Coronations 1937, Crown Colonies and Dominions compl et e, v. f . 

face valt~e $9.00 . 

British Central Africa 190-±, 10 pounds, #69, ''Specimen'' surch·arge, 

Catalogues $275.00 regularly, v ery fine .......... .. ............................ .. . 

Canada 185'.2 tip Green black #5, thin spot, good margins 

--1858, 3p red #1'2, very good ............................. .. ....................... .. .. 

--1859, 2c Rose, #18, Yery gootl . 
--1859 1/c Blue # 20, vur,\' good 

--1875, Sc Hcgist cr, #li54, fi11 c, no gum 

--10c Bro\\'n on " ·hitc cut square, quocn Vic toria , ve1:y fiue, ,Tarrct t 

$10.00 .. .. . . ... . . 

15.00 

1'5~00-

20.00 

16.0.0 

30.00 

30.00 

7'5.00 

17.00 

19.00 

l!i.5o 
22.00 

19po 
25.00 

30.00 

2.'2 .50 

17:Go 

7.00 

7.00 

1'.2.00 

o,{:~39'!J 

~ (,o ~ 

l ;-r-~ 

Cape of Good Hope 18li3, 1p Brown red, 'l'riang le, # 12, fine 11.00 

Ceylon 1872-82 2c-24c, 48c; 16c, 20c ; #63-68, 71; . Sil , 84, very good... .... ...... 34.50 

--1885, 5o, 5o, 20c, 25c, #93, 96, 102-04, very good ... .. :.. ... 23.50 

v' (.) ~ --1885, 1r12c on 2r50c, #108, pair, fine -.... 

{ <("Q 4-Qi!- --1888-90, #133a, 134a, 137, 138b, 139, 141d, very ·good 

{ 'll["' ~ Chile 1907, 1 peso, Dark browu & black #317, fine . .. .......... .. .. .. .. . 

J' o ~ Cyp1·us 1880 6p, 30p on 1p, #5, 7, very good ............ .............. .. ...... . 
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20.00 

27.50 

60.00 

16.00 
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1 YJ~ 406 
(.J'], 407 

Cuba 1899 2c Invl:'rtecl surcharge # 222c, very fin e ...... ............................ ....... ......... 150.00 
Danish West Indies 1901-5, #21, P a ir, # 35, T wo coyers t ied, fine 

t!Jo ~ 
1 1r 40!:),... 

Diego ::luar·ez 1892 10(l-30e # 108-11, 20e is used, .fine . 14.50 
l<'rance 1870 5fr, Gray lilac, Type I & II, # 36, 36a, thin spots . . 24.00 

3Y~ 
1- -:- 411 

--1937, Internationa l Colonial Exposition, 21 set s complet e, very fin e 2•5.00 
French Colonies 1871 5c Yellow green, # 8, fine . . . ..... ................ 30.00 

I 1 .::_ 412 --1871, SOc Rose # 13, very good . 12.50 

31J --1937, Internat ional Exposition, Minia_tur·e sheet s, 24 diff., one for 
each Colony, vet·y fin e .... . 

q.J' ,Wi<4'* France, Turkish Offices, 1890, 20 pia on 5f r, Red Lilac #6, fin e I'JXCept 
thin spot ... ..... ... ....... ... .................... ... .. ... ......... ......... ....... ...... ..... ........... 10.00 

French Guiana 1888, 10c on 75c Ca rmine, # 11, smeared surcharge,- yery 
good ....... ... .. .. .............. . 15.00 

11.40 

12.00 
25.00 
15.00 
16.75 

3 'f-2-- 416*EBGermany 1859-67, 14 Block s of 6, Bet ween Nos. 13- <i 2, very fine. 
I '?O ~itt Gold Coast 1889, 10sb, Lilac & r ed # 23, fin e ................. ....... . .. ... .. .. ... ........ . 

/'1.,;.::: 418 Great Britain 1878 10sh slate #72, thin spot . 
I c? .. !~-A19* Greece 191'2, 10pa, 2pi #890, 893, fine . 
y-fo 2e"jtf Guam 1899 2c, 5c, 10c, 10c Special Deliv:ery #2, 5, 8, 101, very good 

L.. -,- 421* --1899, 5c, 10c, #5, 8, very fin e ...................................... .. ................ .......... . 
/ q IJ -4:2-~ --1899, 10c Specia l Delivery, # 101, fine . 
,l.J"~ 423 H awaii 1859 5c Blue, #22, fine . 

f 'fo ~ --1890-93, 5c, 25c, #52c, Three copies, #<i4, very good . 
/ J-~-~ H cligol and 1875 1pf, 5pf-50pf, #14, 16-19, fin e . ur: ~· --1876-90, 3pf, 20pf, 20pf , # 20, 21, 2lb, fine 
).. UU ~ Hong Kong 1862 2-18c, #1-4, very good . 

/ rl,:!.:±:Z8* - - 1862, 12c blue, 18e lila c, # 3, 4, no gum 
l,. 0! ±29* --1862, 24c Green # 5, tw o copies . 
,-.....~ 43~ --1863-67, 2c-12c, 24c, # 8-12, 14, v er y good 
I f.J',131* --18il-760__1 6c Y ellow, 96c Gr ay, # 18, 20 , one with thin spot . 

/ 91J . --1874 $10.00 Rose, # 203, perfs cut in R . 

"'L- '1 9- 433* ffiltaly 1901, 25c Deep blue, Imprint block of 8, # 81 . .. 
1-'1.:_.±3±* Italy, Offices Abroad, 10c Buff, 20c Blue, # 4, 5, very good . 
( 'V-~35* -- --18'74, 20e Blue, 2L Vermilion, #5, 9, very good . 
( OJ~ Lib·e:ia.1860-80, #2•, 18, 19, 20 (2) , very good .... .. .......................... . 
~ I ~ 437* --1864, 6c Red imperf. , #7a, fine ...................... . 

/ 1~43 8 Malta 1918 5sh Scarlet and green, #61, very good . . 
1 J~39* Mauritius 1863-78, 1sh, 17c, # 37, 54 (2) , no gum on latter . 
1 b 0~ Natal 1902-09, 2sh6p, 1sh, 2sh, 2sh , #91-9 2, 106-107, 112, fine . 

....... . 
'),:l-~441*EBNewfoundland 1880 3c Blue # 42, Block of 9, no gum, v.ery good . .. 
l 3J_.... ~!Newfoundland 1880 3c Blue, #42, Impi·int block of 6, no gum . 
{/~443 New Caledonia 1881 25c on 35c, # 3, heavy cane. 
3 ra ~ New South Wales 1850 3p green #9, fine . ......................... . 

/1-D ~ --1860, 6p Violet, ·wmkd. 12, #40c, no gum ... . 

/ ~46* Nicaragua 1869-78, # 3-12, fine set . 

/ ~447* --1869, 2c-25c, # 4-12, ve ry fine . 

--14 ---

8.50 
7.00 

30.00 
13.50 
21.00 
23.50 
28.00 
17.00 
30.00 
14.75 
20.00 
20.00 
12. 00 
25.00 
15.00 
10.30 
25.00 
18.00 
19.00 
16.50 

22.50+ 
15.00+ . 

12.00 
30.00 
15.00 
13.20 

12.15 



f J ~448*F£--18G9 -78, 2c Blue #4, Block of 4_ & G, #9, J3lock of 4, ve z·y fin e . 

/ V~49*F£--1890- 1903, # 2'2a, pair and block, #24a, pair and singl e, #1G7b 

( 14) fine .......... ....... . . ............. .............................. ................ .. . 

f 0~50*F£,--1890, 1 P eso, #2.4a, Block of n, very fin e .. . 

/ J !!.--451*F£-- 1894-98, 25c, 30c, #G5b, ·Block #142, Pair, very fin e . 

tj--v.J ~ Oldenburg 1858 3g Yellow, # 8, fin e . 

/ kf........-453* Philippines 1903, 4c, #229, fine . 

go~ --1903 13c, 15c, #234-35, corner perf off each . 

J'l4..-455* --1906, 2c-1p, #241-51, fin e .......................... . 

J .f<'.-456* --1909, 2 Peso, Viol et brown # 260a, surcharged O.B., fin e . 

6 1.:('457* --1911, 10 P eso, Deep green, #274, Sureharged O.B., very fin e ... 

lf: ~458* --1931, 2c Green, Imperf, # 340, Plate no pan e of 100, v.f . . 

'f'b:;_. 459* --1916, 20c Special D eliver y #754, very fin e 

L{.J ~460* Porto Rico 1899, 1c-10c Postage Dues, #301-3, Gibbons net $8.25, fin e 

3 -vo_461 Queensland 1860, 1p Deep rose, #1, very good . 

/ 3 ° ~ Rhodesia 1917, 1 pound Violet a nd black, # 136, fin e ...................................... . 

, .Jb 463* Russia 1919, 3k Carmine and gray black, #12•14, very fine . 

/ ~ ~64*F£Salvador 1891 1c-1p, complete set, in trial color imperf blocks of f our, 

#47-56, very fine . . 

/ I 3., 465 St. Vincent 1880 4p Ultramarine, # 27, thin spot .... :· .......... . 

.?..I' 466*F£Siam, 1883, 1att, 1py, #2-3, Block of each, 1 stain ed .. 

~ v.£467* --1885, lt on 1sol, #11, fin e . ·················· ·········· ·· 
,q 0 468*F£-- 1887-1908, #12, 32, 39, 94, 111-12, Block of each, vm·y fine 

/I~ 469*F£-- 1895-1918, #47-49, 54, 111, 114, 161-62, 176, Block of each, v .f .. 

.. tJo 470 --1900-08, Thit·ty-on e stamps, b et ween #75-110, so me unused, fine . . 

/ 1-:£471 --1883-1912, Twenty-six diffet·ent, fine lot . . ..... . ................... . 

.J,02--472 Switzerland, Pro-.Tuventute, 80 d iff. complete, fin e . 

. 9" 47,3 Tmkey 1914, 1pi on 1lhpi, Double surchat·ge, # 277b, four copies, v.f . . 

• Jf-'474* --1!H7, 5pa Purple, Double Smcharg e, on e inverted, #48(ia, v . fin e 

/ _['o ~ _ Uruguay 1859-60, 120c Blue, 180c Green, #11, 16, ·fine ........ .... ... ....... ............ . 

~::-~Zanzibar, 1895-9(;, Strip of 3, # 31a, S ingl e #7, on small piere of cov et· . 

FOREIGN WHOLESALE 

/; 477* Albania 1925, '2q t·ed bl'Own #187 (100 ) 

/ -;- 478* - - 1925, 5q Green #188 (100) 

;; 479* --1925, 10q Red rose #189 (100 ) 

/_J"'!).-4-80* --1925, 25q Dark blue #191 (lOO) 

/ -:- 481* --1927, 10q Rose red #200 (100) 

/ ~482* --1927, 25q Dark blu e # 202 (100) 

"J J"'483* --1928, 5q on '25q Dark blu e # 209 (100 ) 

b ('~84* --1928, 25q Deep hlu e # 2•3'2 (100) 
.... 

15 

Hi.+5 

11.75 

9.00 

15.00 

60.00 -

8.00 

6.00 

14.33 

6 .50 

17.50 

20:00 

20.00 

8.35 

60.00 

12.00 

4.00 

15:-oo 
5.00 

20.00 

6.70 

9.50 

9.70 

13.24 

15.00 

45.90 

10.00 

10.00 

1.2.00 
20.00 

10.00 

15.00 

8.00 

10.00 



I , 

Jr :-:85* --1928, .50q Libc rose # 233 (100) ......................... .. . 
. .rt' 486* --1929, 5q on 25q Dai·k blue, #239 (100) ... . 
1 -:""" 487* - -1926, 10q-50q #366-369 (10 each ) ...................... . 
/ _(J.....-~ --1925, Airpost, 5q-50q, #fi01-4 (10 each) 

!f-{4.80 Belgium 1929-3 0, 4fr-l?fr #1 273-7± (100 each ) ...... . 
'JAsti 490 Brit. Coloni es (4000 rnhed ), good stock fo r cheap approvals . --1 ,~91* Bulgaria 1918, 1s-10s, #130-33 (100 each ) ............................... . 

1 u~492 Cape of Good Hope 1882-84, # 34 (50), 35 (50), 43 (9) 
. 6 o 493* China 1912 %c Brown #119 (100) ................... ........ .... .... . 

6 u~China, Great Wall (100) ....... ........................................... . 

'}...-:- 495* Costa Rica, 1926, 2c, 5c, 10c, 20c #474, 477, 479-80 (100 each) 
/ tJo ~ --1937, 1c-3c Diamon<ls, # 32S-30 (100 sets) ................................. .. . 

J 1_9...497* E cuador, 1938, U. S. Constitution, 2c-2s # 366-72 (10 sets) 
], I _E.A98* --1938, Airpost, U. S. Cons t itution, 2c-2s, # 532-38 (10 sets) .... . 

4.0.00 

5.00 
10.50 

G.70 

-LOO 

14.00 

llA5 

G.QO 

15.0Q 
10.00 

J J' 499* France, Offices in Morocco 1902, 1c on 1c Gray, #11 (100) ........................ . 

8.10 
8.10 

8.00 

-----J J ~Germany 1934-35, 6pf, 12):>f #442, 450 (100 each ) 
lfO -wT- --1934, 6pf-12pf #444-45 (100 each ) .................. ........... . 
lf<J- ·§~ --1935, 6pf-12pf #465-66 (100 each) ........................ . 

1 l..!,.. 503 - - 1934, 12rpf plus 3I·pf , H enna brown # 8±4 (100) 

7.00 
5.00 
6.00 

10.00 

{'7a ~* Great Britain lhp-1%p King E•dward VIII, # 2•30-32 (120 each ) face 

. -JO 511* 

. rll 512* 

1 ..-:-51i* 

/1-!Ji14* 
I~"~ 
/bU MfF 

{6o ~ 
-~1) 518* 

. f.:> 519* 

t./~~ 
. t;o 521 

1 6,!... 522 

.r 523* 

~ 524* 

I -

$7.20, very fine .............................................. ... ......................... .. ......... . 
--Same as above ........................ . 

Greece 1923; '#296, 308, 315 (10 each) .... 

Hond~ras 1929-31, 50c, 1p, #642, 652 (10 each) 

Hungary 1888 lfl # 34 ( 40), very good .................................. ....... . 
--1926-27, #403-16, 418-21 (100 each) 

19.20 
19.20 

12.00 

17.00 

10.00 
37.00 

Latin Amel'ica, ovel' twenty vaTieties (30,500 ' stamps) good for appi·o-
vals Ol' packets .. 

Latvia 1921 2r on 35k Brown, # 87 (100) .. 
Lithuanja 1922 2 auk, #106 (100 ) ............. .... .. .................. .. .............. ............. .. 

M exico Ui85 1c Pale green #1fi5 (21) 
l\fonaco 1885 lc, 2c, #1 (57 ) , #2 (8) . ... ..... .... ........ . 

NetheTlands 1852-(i7 #2 (2), 5 (il), fi (1), 11. (4) 
--1931-33 # 212, 217 (100 .of: eacl1) 

Newfoundland 1929 5c Sln.te green #.HHi (100 ) 

P er sia 1882 5s Green #53 (100 ) ....... .. .. 

Nicaragua 1878 2c Blue #9 (8) very fine .. .. 

Peru 1860 1p Rose #10) (17) very good .. . 

Russia 1937 10k-50k #590-93 (10 sets) 

--1924, 20k on lOt· #909 (100 ) ...... 

Salvador, 18 varieties (10 each ) ....... ........ ........................... .. .. ...... . 

Spain 1931, Airpost., 5e-4p # 765-70 (10 sets) . 

- :16 -

6.00 
(i.OO 

21:ol'l 
1fi.OO 

21.% 
:12.00 

10.00 

(i.OO 

10.00 

... 127.50 

4.80 

12.00 

6.!l0 



/~25 · 

{~26* 
1 A-!- 527 
• J ""'J,.... 528 

Straits Settlem ents 1867-83 #10 (22), 45 (86), 46 (2), 47 (7), 48 (2), 

521 (1) ··· ·· ·························· ..................... . 

--1882,83 # 44 (16) , 46 (2), 47 (2), 49 (5), fin e : 

Sweden 1935 #234-36 (100 each ) 

--1921-25, #147, 203 -04, 206 (100 each ) 

1,- '7.5?..-529 Tannou Touva 1935, 1k-5t (10 set s) . 

1 , ~530* Tmkey, Local, fom· varieties (100 each ) 
sO ~ Ukrainia, 1920, 1gl·-10gr, #156-60 (100 each ) . 
cto ~ Uruguay 1929, 4c Airpost, # 638 (23) ...................... . 

'fr~ Ven ezuela., Instruction, seven varieties (100 each ) ...... . 

-~ . )' 

'h .'i END OF SALE- MAIL :SIDS EARLY. 
,;, l ~ 

•f\. 

•·' 
.I· 

·"' 

I . - .. 
-17~ 

21.25 
18,60 

12.00 

8.00 

10.00 

8.05 
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Due to the Wol'ld's Fair bein.g held in New York, 

we are holding auction" sales through the summer 

months. Material solicited for coming sales. 

Collectors and dealers m·e welcome to visit our 

office while attending the fair and will be glad 

to be of any assistance. 

We carry a good stock of U. S. Want lists of . 

collectors and dealers solicited. We are always 

in the market to purchase U. S. 

, , 
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BID SHEET 58th SALE 

ROBERT A. SIEGEL 

116 Nassau Street, New York, N. Y. 

Please purchase for me at your Auction to be held in New York, JUNE 29th, 
19'39, the lots named below, the prices annexed being my limit on each lot. 1 
agree to r emit for purchases in accordance with the terms of the sale and to 
r eturn no lots later than two days after receipt. 

Yours truly, 
References: 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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_ When Time is Short (especially from the West) please send bids by Airmail.-


